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Story #1 
A long time ago I tried to find hidden gold in olive store on my 
journey.  I trusted the merchant to keep my gold, but he was very 
greedy.  I thought he stole my gold.  We argued each other, and 
then we went to the king to judge who is right.  The king had very 
clever children.  He pretended to judge wrong.  The children 
judged the merchant was innocent because he didn't know the 
gold was in the store.  The king praised them and gave the 
reward.  We apologized each other. 
 
 
Story #2 
One man went to the store bought some olives.  He stole and 
hidden gold.  A merchant trust him.  After man went on a journey.  
On the journey this greedy man stole again.  A merchant catch 
him and argue the king to judge a man.  But this man has clever 
children.  They thought the gold was reward. 
 
 
 
Story #3 
Once there was a merchant and he had some gold.  He didn't 
trust any of his four children.  Before his leaving for a long 
journey, he tried to find a good place to hide his gold.  Finally he 
decided to keep the gold under the ground of one of olives trees 
in his garden to be hidden from his children.  After his return 
from the journey, he found the gold was stolen and asked the 
merchant took all his children to the king for his judgement who 
stole the gold.  They argued each other before the king.  Four 
children were taken to the judge.  All of them were very clever 
enough to pretend to be innocent.  Finally king put them on test. 


